PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

Memo To: All Bidders of York County Quote# 556 /12-12-2023
From: Teria G. Sheffield, Procurement Director

Subject: Solicitation Awarded

Date: December 18, 2023

Quotes were received on December 12, 2023 for the purchase of Automotive Filters and has
been awarded to Advance Stores Company Incorporated dba Advance Auto Parts of
Raleigh NC.

Tabulation is below for your convenience.

We sincerely appreciate your time involved in submitting a quote.

Q556val
TGS/jc

PO Box 180, 6 South Congress Street, York, SC 29745
Telephone: 803-684-8520 Fax: 803-684-8580 Web: www.yorkcountygov.com



http://www.yorkcountygov.com/
http://www.yorkcountygov.com/

Q556- FILTER QUOTE

JANUARY 1, 2024 - DECEMBER 31, 2024

Advance Auto Parts

Brand: Carquest

OReilly Auto Parts

Brand: Wix

Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
24006 89006 $ 7.10 24006 $15.01
24013 90254P $ 12.59 24013 $15.41
24017 90266P $ 8.74 24017 $19.82
24029 89029 $ 13.99 24029 $29.51
24068 90273P $ 6.82 24068 $13.20
24070 89070 $ 7.87 24070 $15.74
24071 89071 $ 9.62 24071 $20.81
24088 89088 $ 55.99 24088 $115.98
24112 89112 $ 44.09 24112 $91.13
24161 90027PT $ 10.49 24161 $26.39
24206 89206 $ 18.19 24206 $37.88
24313 89313 $ 10.14 24313 $21.98
24374 89374 $ 47 .24 24374 $90.14
24419 90288P $ 8.74 24419 $21.98
24428 89428 $ 9.44 24428 $19.01
24466 Carquest # 89466 $ 12.07 24466 $26.27
24479 90228P $ 8.74 24479 $21.98
24579 90206P $ 8.67 24579 $17.61
24616 89616 $ 14.34 24616 $29.77
24870 No Bid

33001 86001 $ 2.09 33001 $6.59
33007 BF7725 $ 4.29 33007 $4.38
33011 86011 $ 2.62 33011 $4.38
33032 86032 $ 2.09 33032 $6.59




33033 86033 $ 2.62 33033 $6.59
33063 86063 $ 9.79 33063 $28.59
33070 No Bid
33097 86097 $ 5.59 33097 $15.41
33109 Carquest # 86109 $ 6.40 33109 $13.18
33115 86115 $ 7.62 33115 $15.26
33118 Carauest # 86118 $ 6.92 33118 $14.64
33120 86120 $ 7.10 33120 $14.86
33121 86125 $ 8.04 33121 $16.08
33122 86122 $ 6.99 33122 $14.31
33166 86166 $ 5.17 33166 $10.78
33192 86192 $ 12.42 33192 $25.31
33195 86195 $ 7.45 33195 $14.86
33196 86196 $ 12.94 33196 $26.00
33211 96535 $20.99 33211 $46.23
33216 Carquest # 86216 $ 11.02 33216 $23.01
Wix # Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
46418 Carquest # 88481 $9.27 46418 $26.39
46425 Carauest # 88425 $ 5.00 46425 $13.20
*9428Carquest # 88428 $ 5.24 46428 $17.61
46429 Carquest # 88429 $ 19.59 46429 $39.36
9433 arquest # 88433 $ 27.29 46433 $56.09
46438FR Carquest # 88438FR | $ 20.64 46438FR $43.66
4490 arquest # 88449 $ 13.12 46449 $26.89
46489 Carquest # 88489 $ 25.89 46489 $49.89
464900 3rauest # 88490 $ 18.19 46490 $37.82
46500 No Bid No Bid 46500 $86.71
19502 arquest # 88502 $61.94 46502 $124.15
48522C arquest # 88522 $ 18.19 46522 $36.22
46530 Carquest # 88530 $33.94 46530 $68.10
46531 Carquest # 88531 $ 26.24 46531 $55.23
954 Carquest # 88541 $51.09 46541 $102.58
46562 Carquest # 88562 $28.69 46562 $58.69




49%%9Carquest # 88569 $17.14 46569 $34.43
49599 Carquest # 88595 $ 31.49 46595 $65.43
45807 Carquest # 88607 $ 40.59 46607 $81.60
46627 Carquest # 88627 $25.89 46627 $51.82
46629 Carquest # 88629 $45.49 46629 $86.53
46664 Carquest # 88664 $ 42.69 46664 $85.95
46671 Carauest # 88671 $24.14 46671 $51.87
46672 Carquest # 88672 $18.89 46672 $37.95
46708Carq uest # 88708 $ 69.99 46708 $151.10
46722 Carquest # 88712 $59.49 46722 $126.00
46723 Carquest # 88723 $37.44 46723 $79.71
46734 Carquest # 88734 $ 57.04 46734 $116.34
46735 Carquest # 88735 $ 74.89 46735 $150.33
46744 Carquest # 88744 $ 34.99 46744 $72.72
46748 Carquest # 88748 $106.39 46748 $220.07
46749 No Bid No Bid 46749 $96.93
46754 Carquest # 88754 $ 22.39 46754 $47.96
46766 Carquest # 88766 $22.04 46766 $46.37
7 Carquest # 88774 $60.19 46774 $122.47
46776 Carquest # 88776 $64.04 46776 $132.66
46777 Carquest # 88777 $ 49.69 46777 $102.79
46782 Carquest # 88782 $ 26.94 46782 $56.44
46784 Carquest # 88784 $72.79 46784 $146.18
46785 Carquest # 88785 $ 37.79 46785 $79.73
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
33217 Carauest # 86217 $24.49 33217 $51.98
33218 86218 $ 8.32 33218 $17.59
33219 Carauest # 86219 $8.67 33219 $18.27
33222 Carauest # 86500 $12.59
33231 Carquest # 86231 $ 26.94 33231 $57.15
33239 86239 $ 7.62 33239 $15.76
33242 86242 $ 16.79 33242 $33.83
33243 Carauest # 86243 $7.69 33243 $17.61
33252 Carauest # 86252 $20.64 33252 $43.45
33270 85270 $7.10 33270 $14.34
33271 No Bid No Bid 33271 $6.59
33273 # 86106 $ 9.62 33273 $16.13
33281 86281 $ 14.34 33281 $28.90
33296 86296 $5.59 33296 $15.41




33304 86304 $ 18.54 33304 | $37.14 |
33361 Carauest # 86961 $9.27 33361 18.72
33338 86338 $ 9.79 33338 23.11
33341 # 86341 $ 8.22 33341 17.16
33345 86345 $20.64 33345 35.33
33352 86352 $6.29 33352 13.51
33353 86353 $ 7.62 33353 15.3
33356 # 86356 $ 9.97 33356 18.82
33357 86357 $ 8.67 33357 18.54
33358 86358 $ 7.34 33358 16.49
33365 86365 $ 15.22 33365 30.48
33366 86366 $ 17.32 33366 34.66
33370 86370 $ 14.69 33370 28.82
33371 #86371 $ 23.44 33371 47.22
33373 86373 $ 9.97 33373 21.07
33377 86377 $ 9.62 33377 20.74
33378 No Bid 33378 27.99
33382 96398 $ 11.72 33382 2412
33391 86391 $ 10.49 33391 22.75
33405 86405 $ 9.27 33405 21.94
33411 86411 $ 22.74 33411 46.56
33416 86416 $ 49.69 33416 94.7
33422 86422 $ 20.64 33422 41.12
33423 86423 $ 36.04 33423 69.65
33424 86424 $ 8.39 33424 24.19
33442 86442 $ 22.04 33442 44.85
Wix # Brand Name Each Price Item | Each Price |
46800 Carquest # 88800 $ 69.99 46800 143.65
46801 Carquest # 88801 $ 45.49 46801 96.32
46804 Carquest # R88804 $ 13.99 46804 26.39
46814 Carquest # 88814 $ 7.34 46814 15.41
46836 Carquest # 88836 $ 37.09 46836 90.71
46837 Carauest # 88837 $39.19 46837 83.88
46845 Carquest # 88845 $ 31.14 46845 65.07
46870 Carquest # 88870 $ 52.14 46870 104.88
46882 Carauest # 88882 $ 69.99 46882 144.79
46893 Carquest # 93116 $137.54

46898 Carauest # 88898 $120.74 46898 241.62
46935 Carauest # 88935 $ 6.64 46935 19.82
46937 Carquest # 88937 $55.29 46937 111.02




46981 Carquest # 88981 $15.39 46981 31
49082 Carquest # 83082 $12.59 49082 26.25
49115 Carquest # 83115 $6.92 49115 19.82
49131 Carquest # 83131 $51.79 49131 114.44
49132 Carquest # 83132 $50.74 49132 123.54
49136 Carquest # 83136 $ 12.59 49136 28.59
49161 Carquest # 83161 $12.59 49161 25.14
49184 Carquest # 83184 $36.39 49184 72.79
49189 Carquest # 93355 $ 19.59 49189 39.31
49190 Carquest # 93354 $ 34.29 49190 $72.18
49275 Carquest # 83275 $ 39.54 49275 $80.65
49276 Carquest # 83276 $ 26.24 49276 $53.86
49288 Carquest # 83288 $16.62 49288 $26.39
49471 Carquest # 83471 $ 32.19 49471 $68.02
49548 Carquest # 83548 $ 25.19 49548 $50.67
49560 Carquest # 83560 $44.44 49560 $89.16
49666 Carquest # 83666 $ 64.74 49666 $140.17
49675 Carquest # 83675 $ 69.29 49675 $138.79
49676 Carquest # 83676 $79.79 49676 $164.01
49832 Carquest # 83832 $77.69 49832 $155.26
49883 Carquest # 83883 $ 8.67 49883 $26.39
49908 Carquest # 83908 $ 17.14 49908 $36.02
49996 Carquest # 83996 $36.39 49996 $76.44
51036 Carquest # 85036 $ 2.62 51036 $8.81
51040 Carquest # 85040 $2.62 51040 $8.81
51042 Carquest # 85042 $2.62 51042 $8.81
51060 Carquest # 85060 $2.62 51060 $8.81
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
33472 86472 $10.49 33472 $20.85
33481 86481 $ 7.34 33481 $19.82
33517 86817 $ 23.79

33519 86519 $ 8.50 33519 $17.79
33522 86522 $ 8.92 33522 $17.79
33525 86525 $ 13.99 33525 $29.31
33528 86528 $ 10.14 33528 $21.62
33531 86531 $ 19.24 33531 $39.87
33532 86532 $ 18.54 33532 $40.38
33536 86536 $ 25.54 33536 $40.37
33549 86536 $ 25.54

33585 R86585 $ 11.19




33587 86587 $ 13.64 33587 $28.46
33588 86588 $ 11.19 33588 $22.41
33595 86595 $ 5.94 33595 $15.41
33604 86604 $ 27.99 33604 $58.79
33626 86626 $ 10.67 33626 $22.91
33633 86633 $20.64 33633 $40.59
33634 86634 $ 16.44 33634 $33.67
33644 86644 $ 13.29 33644 $27.49
33648 86648 $ 20.99 33648 $35.03
33668 86668 $ 18.19 33668 $37.05
33680 86680 $ 16.09 33680 $36.75
33682 86682 $ 14.69 33682 $30.07
33683 86683 $ 33.24 33683 $73.95
33690 86690 $ 11.02 33690 $23.52
33697 86697 $ 11.54 33697 $24.71
33736 86806 $ 34.29 33736 $66.27
33744 86744 $ 29.04 33744 $62.39
33747 86747 $ 19.24 33747 $44.32
33752 86752 $ 22.39 33752 $44.77
33753 86753 $ 29.74 33753 $60.00
33759 86759 $ 16.09 33759 $34.00
33765 86765 $ 16.27 33765 $30.39
33774 86774 $ 29.74 33774 $57.56
33775 86775 $ 28.34 33775 $60.00
33778 86778 $ 42.69 33778 $91.72
33788 86788 $ 27.29 33788 $59.33
33801 86801 $ 24.14 33801 $48.22
33804 86804 $ 19.94 33804 $44.35
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
51061 Carquest # 85060 $ 2.62 51061 $11.02
51068 Carquest # 85085 $ 2.62 51068 $8.81
51084 Carquest # 85307HD | § 5.35 51084 $15.98
51085 Carquest # 85085 $ 2.62 51085 $8.81
51133 Carquest # 85133 $ 8.04 51133 $16.17
51158 Carquest # 85158 $ 12.59 51158 $18.86
51163 Carquest # 85163 $ 9.44 51163 $18.92
51173 Carquest # 85173 $ 6.22 51173 $13.22
51195 Carquest # 85195 $ 15.39 51195 $32.46
51196 Carquest # 84252 $ 6.22 51196 $13.97
51202 Carquest # 85202 $ 16.62 51202 $33.34




51242 Carquest # 85242 $ 6.92 51242 $13.87
51243 Carquest # 85243 $ 5.00 51243 $10.87
51268 Carquest # 85268 $ 4.72 51268 $10.28
51269 Carauest # 85269 $ 6.47 51269 $13.86
51279 Carauest # 85279 $ 10.32 51279 $20.72
51334 Carquest # 85334 $ 2.62 51334 $8.81
51344 Carquest # 85344 $ 6.64 51344 $14.16
51348 Carquest # 85348 $ 2.62 51348 $8.81
51372 Carquest # 85372 $ 2.62 51372 $8.81
51394 Carquest # R85394 $ 2.30 51394 $8.81
51403 Carquest # 85405 $ 12.42 51403 $26.22
51407 Carquest # 85407 $ 11.54 51407 $24.54
51417 Carquest # 85417 $ 15.39 51417 $31.38
51452 Carquest # 85452 $ 6.92 51452 $15.06
51455 Carquest # 85455 $32.19 51455 $66.78
51459 Carquest # 85459 $ 7.97 51459 $17.16
51479 Carquest # 85479 $ 11.72 51479 $23.13
51495 Carquest # 85495 $ 34.99 51495 $75.00
51506 Carquest #85506 $ 9.97 51506 $20.02
51515 Carquest # 85515 $ 2.62 51515 $8.81
51516 Carquest # 85516 $ 2.62 51516 $8.81
51521 Carquest # 85085 $ 2.62 51521 $12.12
51551 Carquest # 85551 $ 6.29 51551 $13.26
51566 Carquest # 85566 $ 52.49 51566 $110.44
51602 Carquest # 85602 $ 5.52 51602 $13.72
51607 Carquest # 85607 $ 5.94 51607 $11.99
51609 Carquest # 85609 $ 4.90 51609 $13.84
51615 Carquest # 85615 $ 58.79 51615 $118.16
51623 Carquest # 85623 $ 17.84 51623 $36.00
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
33827 86827 $ 16.27 33827 $32.64
33838 86838 $ 26.24 33838 $54.42
33936 86936 $ 16.97 33936 $35.22
33937 86937 $ 9.44 33937 $39.63
33960 96960XE $ 38.14 33960 $66.71
33965 86965 $ 30.09 33965 $62.22
33966 Carquest # 86966 $ 15.92 33966 $31.89
33985 86985 $ 31.14 33985 $60.71
42012 Carquest # 87012 $ 32.89 42012 $67.28
42098 R87098 $ 7.20 42098 $13.20




42119 87542XP $ 46.19 42119 $71.84
42133 87133 $ 5.24 42133 $13.20
42253 87253 $ 39.19 42253 $82.24
42385 87793 $ 6.29 42385 $13.20
42471 # 87471 $ 38.14 42471 $76.45
42484 87484 $ 6.64 42484 $19.82
42487 R87487 $ 11.75 42487 $26.39
42488 FDA8755A $ 8.50 42488 $28.59
42491 87491 $ 55.64 42491 $111.49
42510 87510 $ 39.19 42510 $81.70
42518 87518 $ 24.49 42518 $50.17
42519 87519 $ 19.59 42519 $41.16
42546 87546 $ 100.09 42546 $207.41
42547 87547 $ 66.14 42547 $132.79
42608 87608 $ 58.09 42608 $121.18
42609 87609 $ 51.44 42609 $109.11
42706 87706 $ 65.79 42706 $138.76
42707 87707 $ 37.79 42707 $78.54
42725 87725 $ 10.32 42725 $33.01
42754 87754 $ 50.39 42754 $106.72
42755 87755 $ 29.74 42755 $63.62
42769 87769 $ 15.04 42769 $30.22
42776 87776 $ 51.44 42776 $103.44
42795 87795 $ 28.69 42795 $56.37
42803 87803 $ 55.64 42803 $114.54
42804 87804 $ 32.54 42804 $68.37
42808 87808 $ 57.04 42808 $123.11
42809 87809 $ 53.19 42809 $115.28
42810 83910 $ 18.89

42812 87812 $ 86.44 42812 $178.72
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
51654 Carquest # 85654 LIEEE 51654 $73.66
51664 Carquest # 85664 $8.32 51664 $17.79
51668 Carquest # 85668 $ 10.84 51668 $20.52
51683 Carquest # 85683 $66.49 51683 $137.05
51685 Carquest # 85685 $54.94 51685 $114.44
51712 Carquest # 85712 $ 10.32 51712 $20.54
51714 Carquest # 85714 $11.02 51714 $23.24
51730 Carquest # 85730 $ 62.99 51730 $131.99




51733 Carquest # 85733 $58.79 51733 $121.65
51734 Carquest # 85734 $ 12.07 51734 $24.36
51741 Carquest # 85741 $ 33.59 51741 $68.18
51742 Carquest # 85742 $9.44 51742 $21.38
51747 Carquest # 85747 $ 13.64 51747 $27.12
51748 Carquest # 85748 $ 29.74 51748 $67.90
51749 Carquest # 85749 $ 17.84 51749 $38.54
51754 Carquest # 85754 $ 9.44 51754 $20.24
51758 Carquest # 85758 $13.99 51758 $28.88
51759 Carquest # 85759 $ 14.52 51759 $32.96
51768 Carquest # 85768 $ 8.32 51768 $16.10
51791 Carquest # 85791 $9.27 51791 $19.44
51798 Carquest # 85798 $10.14 51798 $22.23
51799 Carquest # 85799 $22.39 51799 $47.13
51812 Carquest # 85970XE | $ 23.79

51820 Carquest # 85820 $ 9.09 51820 $19.82
51824 Carquest # 85824 $15.57 51824 $31.37
51860 Carquest # 85860 $ 22.74 51860 $44.74
51863 Carquest # 85863 $ 62.99 51863 $130.00
51866 Carquest # 85866 $33.24 51866 $66.97
51977 Carquest # 85977 $ 12.17

57004 Carquest # 84004 $ 37.44 57004 $79.28
57037 Carquest # 84037 $ 14.34 57037 $29.95
57043 Carquest # 84043 $51.79 57043 $104.23
57044 Carquest # 84044 $48.64 57044 $102.33
57045 Carquest # 84502 $ 2.62 57045 $8.81
57060 Carquest # 84060 $ 2.62 57060 $8.81
57076 Carquest # 84076 $ 6.75 57076 $13.57
57082 Carquest # 84082 $5.00 57082 $11.02
57091 Carquest # 84091 $ 115.14 57091 $240.35
57094 Carquest # 84094 $11.19 57094 $23.81
57116 Carquest # 84116 $ 10.32 57116 $20.45
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
42824 87824 $ 37.79 42824 $78.48
42843 87823 $10.67 42843 $19.82
42847 87847 $ 86.09 42847 $178.03
42848 87848 $ 58.09 42848 $116.31
42924 87924 $ 22.74 42924 $48.41
42942 87942 $ 50.04 42942 $98.91
42947 87947 $ 23.09 42947 $49.00




42966 87966 $ 42.69 42966 $86.45
42985 87985 $ 14.52 42985 $30.43
46077 88077 $ 5.24 46077 $13.20
46080 88080 $ 5.59 46080 $17.61
46117 Carquest # 88117 $ 8.67 46117 $17.61
46126 88126 $ 3.95 46126 $13.20
46139 88139 $ 4.02 46139 $13.20
46174 88174 $ 5.59 46174 $15.41
46180 R88180 $ 6.85 46180 $13.20
46253 R88253 $ 9.44 46253 $19.82
46255 88255 $ 14.34 46255 $30.35
46281 88281 $ 40.24 46281 $79.38
46302 88302 $ 6.92 46302 $17.61
46346 88346 $ 23.79 46346 $49.98
46350 88350 $ 73.14 46350 $149.02
46360 87276FR $ 18.54
46393 88393 $ 24.14 46393 $49.66
46407 88407 $ 46.19 46407 $95.75
46416 88416 $ 7.62 46416 $24.19
D07B10GAV NO BID
D44A10GAV 94173 $ 43.04
D85A06GV NO BID No Bid D85A06GV $102.26
WO01AG403 94139 $ 22.39 WO01AG403 $41.70
WO01AG436 95093 $ 72.44 WO01AG436 $97.97
WA10129 NO BID No Bid
WA10162 93813 $ 27.99 WA10162 $59.46
WA10167 93339 $ 66.49 WA10167 $133.81
WA10315 518216 $ 8.22 WA10315 $21.98
WA10385 93814 $ 23.09 WA10385 $46.57
WA10679 93837 $ 44.44 WA10679 $88.01
WA10697 98220 $ 20.64 WA10697 $57.22
WA10714 93760 $ 81.54 WA10714 $167.80
WA10804 93786 $ 101.49 WA10804 $210.36
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
57130 Carquest # 84130 $54.94 57130 $115.75
57131 Carquest # 84131 $8.67 57131 $15.92
57137 Carquest # 84137 $27.64 57137 $55.11
57140 Carquest # 84140 $31.84 57140 $67.41
57151 Carquest # 84151 $14.87 57151 $30.74
57182 Carquest # 84182 $9.79 57182 $19.90




57190 Carquest # 84190 $16.44 57190 $32.95
57201 Carquest # 84201 $ 34.29 57201 $76.78
57202 Carquest # 84202 $7.80 57202 $16.21
57215 Carquest # 84215 $ 13.64 57215 $27.45
57220 Carquest # 84220 $ 37.79 57220 $76.02
57221 Carquest # 84221 $31.84 57221 $64.81
57243 Carquest # 84243 $ 12.24 57243 $25.80
57247 Carquest # 96459 $45.49 57247 $96.73
57259 Carquest # 84259 $22.39 57259 $46.41
57291 Carquest # 94347 $57.39 57291 $58.07
57300 Carquest # 84300 $22.04 57300 $46.07
57404 Carquest # 84404 $ 44.09 57404 $94.25
57421 NO BID No Bid 57421 $65.81
57488 Carquest # 84488 $ 13.47 57488 $28.90
57502 Carquest # R84502 $ 2.30 57502 $8.81
57526 Carquest # 84526 $ 2.90 57526 $8.81
57602 Carquest # 84602 $ 69.99 57602 $143.46
57624 Carquest # 84624 $ 56.69 57624 $108.51
57702 Carquest # 96031 $ 10.32 57702 $34.49
57703 Carquest # 84703 $24.84 57703 $50.14
57709 Carquest # 84709 $41.99 57709 $84.42
57723 Carquest # 84723 $36.74
57730 Carquest # 84730 $5.70 57730 $11.91
57740 Carquest # 84740XE $67.54
57745XD Carquest # 84745XD $48.99 57745XD $102.95
577508 Carquest # 84750S $13.12 577508 $26.08
57755 Carquest # 84755 $64.74 57755 $134.59
57794 Carquest # 84794 $ 26.24 57794 $53.08
57841 Carquest # 84841 $39.89 57841 $81.23
57852 Carquest # 84852 $ 65.44 57852 $139.36
57899 Carquest # 85372 $2.62 57899 $8.81
58890 Carquest # 85890 $ 19.59 58890 $32.50
WP10195 Carquest # 527998 $4.89 WP10195 $28.59
WP10281 Carquest # 93602 $ 38.14 WP10281 $80.39
Wix# Brand Name Each Price Item Each Price
WA10808 Carquest # 93763 $ 36.39 WA10808 $75.55
WF10078 Carquest # 96078 $ 56.69 WF10078 $112.04
WF10081 Carquest # 96081 $ 8.04 WF10081 $17.49
WF10164 Carauest # 96516 $ 26.59 WF10164 $55.77
WF10171 Carquest # 96721 $ 37.79 WF10171 $82.12




WF10385 Carquest # 96857 $ 18.19 WF10385 $36.45
WL10010 Carquest # 94010 $ 3.49 WL10010 $8.81
WL10186 Carquest # 84723 $ 36.74 WL10186 $67.88
WL10255 Carquest # R84502 $ 2.30 WL10255 $8.81
WP10001 Carquest # 99014 $ 29.04 WP10001 $61.40
WP10005 Carquest # 99018 $ 53.19

WP10034 Carquest # 99056 $ 12.07 WP10034 $26.15
WP10129 Carquest # 91129 S8.67 WP10129 $21.98
WP10154 Carquest # 93401 $ 39.19 WP10154 $83.54
WP10160 Carquest # 93663 $ 16.97 WP10160 $33.90
WP10181 Carquest # 93596 $ 64.04 WP10181 $135.08
WP10182 Carquest # 93595 $ 51.79 WP10182 $108.23
WP10188 Carquest # 93402 $ 11.19 WP10188 $22.59
WS10147 NO BID No Bid WS10147 $64.35

Total / Each Bidder $ 7,445.01 $20,916.99

Pricing held firm until June 30,
2024 w/ maximum 10%
Contingency starting July 1,
2024



	Sheet1

